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Dawne Kelly '

From: Jennifer Muliigan

Sent: Monday, August 26, 2013 10:43 AM
To: Dawne Kelly

Subject: September 12th agenda

Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Flag Status: Flagged

Categories: Red Category

Hi Dawne - Can you add the following resolution? Laberge has billed for services related to assisting the Town with
analyzing the sale of water to EG under the general wastewater addendum. Since that addendum only addresses
wastewater, we need a resolution to amend to include water services.

Original Resofution:#13-125: Authorize Supervisor Dowds to execute and administer Professional Services Proposal
dated April 10, 2013, Addendum No. 04 with Laberge Group, LLC relative to wastewater in the Town in an amount not to
exceed $10,000.00.

Proposed Resolution: Amend Resolution No. 2013-125 to include services related to wastewater and water.

Since the billing explicitly states that the services are water related, 1 am unable to process the bill under the wastewater
contract. The Town has requested the services and it must be paid, therefore 1 do not see an issue with this minor
language change. Also there will be future services that will be billed.

Thanks,
Jen

Tenmifer L. Mulligan, CPA, Comptroller

Town of Schodack | 265 Schuurman Road | Castleton, New York 12033

Ph: 518-477-7919 ext. 319 | Fx: 518-477-6546 | email: jennifer@schodack.org
web: www.schodack.org

Confidentiality Notice:

This message {including any attachments) is intended for the use of the individual er entity ko whom it is addressed and may contain information that is
privileged and cenfidential. If you are not the intended recipient, or the employee or agent responsible for delivering it to the intended recipient, you shall
not disseminate, distribute or copy this information and communication to any individual(s) not specifically identified in the above address headings.
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Dawne Kelly

From: Kathleen Blake

Sent: Thursday, July 18, 2013 1159 AM

To: Dawne Kelly

Subject; FW: Price Decrease for ADP Pay Expert
Attachments: PL2 0056 3 Yr Price Agreement.pdf

Hi Dawne - The worst case scenario would be if we cancelled with ADP. A (3} month processing fee would then be
invoked.

Kathy Blake

Payroll & Personnel Clerk
Town of Schodack

265 Schuurman Rd.
Castleton, NY 12033

Ph (518) 477-3628

Fax (518) 477-9594
kathleen@schodack.org

Confidentiality Notice:

This message (including any attachments) is intended for the use of the individual or entity to whom if is addressed and may contain information that is
privileged and confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, or the employee or agent responsible for delivering i to the intended recipient, you shail
not disseminafte, distribute or copy this information and communication to any individual(s) not specifically identified in the above address headings.

From: Kathleen Blake

Sent: Wednesday, July 17, 2013 8:57 AM

To: Dennis Dowds; James Bult (jameshuli@amail,com); Curtis, Frank (FCurtis@rensco.com); m.kenney3@verizon.net;
scottswar@amail.com

Skrbiect: Price Decrease for ADP Pay Expert

Happy Wednesday Everyone:
| am happy to announce the following per the attached agreement:

7/13  noincrease
7/14 2.5
7/15 2.5

They were originally asking for 4.5% increase this year.
Have a Great Day!
Kathy

Kathy Blake

Payroll & Personnel Clerk
Town of Schodack

265 Schuurman Rd.
Castleton, NY 12033

Ph (518) 477-3628

Fax {518) 477-9594



kathleen@schodack.org

Confidentiality Notice:

This message (including any attachments) is intended for the use of the individual or entity to whom it is addressed and may contain information that is
privileged and confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, or the employee or agent responsible for delivering it to the intended recipient, you shall
not disseminate, distribute or copy this information and communication to any individual{s) not specifically identified in the above address headings.

From: Potts, Sue A [mailto: Sue. Polts@adp.com]
Sent: Tuesday, July 16, 2013 10:05 AM

Fo: Kathleen Blake

Subject: ADP Case 026233002 Price Agreement

Dear Kathie,

Your concern in relation to the price increase % is understandable in the current economy and we appreciate
you giving us the opportunity to work with you on this, | can offer to reduce the increase to 2%, or we can
exclude you completely with a sighed agreement like the one | have attached. Signing this would allow me to
rescind this vear's increase and limit increases for the next two years to a maoximum of 2.5%, please contact me
at yeur convenience and let me know your thoughts. | am available Monday - Friday 8:30 ~ 5:00, to address
your concerns, We appreciate your business and ook forward 1o working with you.

Thank you for choosing ADP o be your service provider,

Swaaw Futts

Susan Polis] Relationship Specialist
ADP Major Accounts | Northeast Service Center

860 851 4274 ext. 6904571 | suepotis@adp.com

ADP WorkForce Now® — an integrated on-line solution Chick Here

This message and any attachments are intended only for the use of the addressee and may contain information
that is privileged and confidential. If the reader of the message is not the intended recipient or an authorized
representative of the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any dissemination of this communication is
strictly prohibited. If you have received this communication in error, notify the sender immediately by return
email and delete the message and any attachments from your system.
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AUTOMATIC DATA PROCESSING, INC.

GUARANTEED

THIRTY-SIX MONTH

PRICE AGREEMENT
Clieat fnformation:
Client Name: Town of Schodack Fffective Date: 7/1/2013
Service Center: D056
Pareit Company Code: 10PL2 Expiration Date 712016
Requested By: Sue Potis
Related Company Codes: NIA
Contiact Information:
Contact: Kathie Biake Phone: {518) 477-3628 Addross: 265 Schuurman Road
City: Castleton State; NY Fipr 12033
ADP, Inc. {"ADP"} is pleased to provide Town of Schodack (*Client") with a guaranteed price agreement covering the Client's ADP services for the
next Hirty-six maonths, subject to the terms and conditions set forth in this agreement.  This agreement encompasses all listed codes and any futire codes that may

be added under the above listed parent code. In consideration of the mutual agreements set forth below, ADP and Client agree as follows:

1} Price Increase: For the next hirtp-six _ month period commencing with the effective date of A0S | ADP will increase
prices per the schedule below on Payroll processing services provided to Chient {"Services"}

Inerease Date Increase %
7/1/2013 No Increase
72014 2.50
F/20LS 2.50

ltems specifically excluded frem this agreement are delivery, reverse wire fees, jurisdiction fees, maintenance fees and year-end services. In the month following the completion of the
guaranteed price period, Client's prices will be subject to the same price ncreases gpphied 1o its other clients of similar size and product urilization unless a renewal agrecinent is signed by both parties.

2} Guaranieed Term: As consideration for the thirg-six  month guaranteed price period, Client agrees to purchase the services for a
minimum guaranteed term of thirty-six reonths conwnencing with the effective date, and thereafter, Client's agreement to purchase the services shall remain in effect

unti cancelled by Chient or ADP wath nimety days prior writien notice

3) Termination Fee: If Client terminates this agreement to purchase services prior o the end of the minimum guaranteed term of no less than
thirfy-six __months, Client agrees to pay ADP a termination fee of three months  of average monthly processing fees for the services (based on an average of the
last three months of processing prior to the date of termination). Foliowing the #hirty-six month guaranieed price penod, siandard fermmation policy

applies based on initial tenms and conditions signed by Client. Tf Client fails to pay the early termination fee or other amounts due hereunder, Client shafl reunburse ADP for any expenses incurred,
nchuding interest and reasonable attorney fees, in collecting ansounts due ADP hereunder that are not under good faith dispute by Client. The termination fee will be waived in the event the company 15
sold, merged or in the event there 1s a material breach of ADP's service commitment. In the event of @ service breach ADP shall be notified in writing as to the specific service issue and shall be granted
sixty days to resolve all issues ta the Chents satisfaction.

THE ADP SERVICES COVERED BY THIS AGREEMENT ARE PROVIDED IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE TERMS AND CONDITIONS SET FORTH IN THE AGREEMENT(S) BETWEEN
CLIENT AND ADP COVERING THE SPECIFIC SERVICES. THIS AGREEMENT SUPPLEMENTS AND DOES NOT SUPERSEDE ANY OF THOSE TERMS AND CONDITIONS. THIS
AGREEMENT IS NOT VALID UNLESS SIGNED BY BOTH PARTIES.

ADP Representative Town of Schodack
Name: ' David Ganely Name
Signature Signarare:
Title: VP Relationship Memt Title:
Date Date:

NOTE: ONLY THE DIVISION VICE PRESIDENT OR FINANCE EXECUTIVE OF THE AFFECTED REGION {8 AUTHORIZED TO EXECUTE THIS PRICE AGREEMENT ON BEHALF OF
ADP



Dawne Kelly

From: Jennifer Mulligan

Sent: Meonday, August 26, 2013 10:43 AM
To: Dawne Kelly

Subject: September 12th agenda

Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Flag Status: Flagged

Categories: Red Category

Hi Dawne ~ Can you add the following resolution? Laberge has billed for services related to assisting the Town with
analyzing the sale of water to EG under the general wastewater addendum. Since that addendum only addresses
wastewater, we need a resclution to amend to include water services.

Original Resolution:#13-125: Authorize Supervisor Dowds to execute and administer Professional Services Proposal
dated Aprif 10, 2013, Addendum No. 04 with Laberge Group, LLC relative to wastewater in the Town in an amount not to
exceed $10,000.00.

Proposed Resolution: Amend Resolution No. 2013-125 to include services related to wastewater and water.

Since the billing explicitly states that the services are water related, | am unable to process the bill under the wastewater
contract. The Town has requested the services and it must be paid, therefore I do not see an issue with this minor
language change. Also there will be future services that will be hilied.

Thanks,
len

Jennifer L. Mulligan, CPA, Comptroller

Town of Schodack | 265 Schuurman Road | Castleton, New York 12033

Ph: 518-477-7919 ext. 319 | Fx: 518-477-6546 | email: jennifer@schedack.org
web: www schodack.org

Confidentiality Notice:

This message (including any attachments) is intended for the use of the individual or entity to whom it is addressed and may contain information that is
privileged and confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, or the employee or agent responsible for delivering it to the intended recipient, you shall
not disseminate, distribute or copy this information and communication to any individual(s) not specifically identified in the above address headings.
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AGREEMENT

Agreement made this day of , 2013, by and
between THE TOWN OF , NEW YORK, hereinafter

referred to as "Town'" and RENSSELAER COUNTY, NEW YORK, with offices
located at 1600 Seventh Avenue, Troy, New York hereinafter referred to
as "County".

1. Cn gelected County Roads as listed on Schedule "A", the Town
will provide all snow plowing and sanding from October 1, 2013
to April 30, 2014. The County will reimburse the Town actual
costs for labor, materials and equipment as follows.

s Labor - hourly wages, regular and overtime plus the cost
of all benefits.

s Material - actual costs for all salt and sand applied to
County Roads.

o Fguipment - hourly rental rates for the equipment rental
as established by the New York State Department of
Transportation.

2. Except as provided hereinafter, the County shall be responsible
for any loss with respect to any tort claim arising from or
occasioned by the manner of performance of the functions under
this Agreement, provided, however, that the Town shall, within
ten (10} days, notify the County of any acticn, proceeding,
claim or demand arising hereunder. The County shall, at its
option, either elect to defend any action brought against the
Town or call upon the Town to defend such action. In the event
that the Town defends the action the County shall reimburse the
Town for all necesgssary expenses, including litigation expenses
incurred by the Town. In no event shall the County be obligated
to defend or indemnify the Town, or any insurer therecf, in any
action, proceeding, claim cor demand arising out of the actual
operation of a Town owned or operated vehicle, whether such
vehicle shall be insured cor sgubject to self insurance, while
engaged in the operation of snow and ice control functions
under this Agreement. '

3. The County shall not unreasgonably interfere with the Town's
attempts to safely plow sald area.



4. The Town acknowledges and agrees that the services to be
furnished by the Town to the County are furnished as an
independent contractor and not as an agent or as officers or
amployees of the County.

5. This agreement has been executed con behalf of the County
pursuant to Resolution G/pending/13 of the Rensselaer County
Legisglature.

THE TOWN OF , NEW YORK

Supervigor

THE COUNTY OF RENSSELAER, NEW YORK

County Executive

STATE OF NEW YORK )
COUNTY OF RENSSELAER ) 88.:

On this day of , 2013, before me
personally came Kathleen M. Jimino, to me perscnally known, who, being
by me duly sworn, did say that(s)he resides at

, New York; that(s}he is the County
Executive of the County of Rensselaer, New York, the municipal
corporation described in and which executed the within instrument;
that the same was so executed pursuant to resclution of the County
Legiglature; that the seal affixed tc said instrument is such
corporate seal and that the same was so affixed pursuant to such
resolution.

NOTARY PUBLIC



STATE OF NEW YORK )

COUNTY OF RENSSELAER )88,

On this day of , 2013, before me
personally canme , to me personally known,
who, being by me duly sworn, did say that (s)he resides
at , New York; that (s)he is the Supervisor of
the Town cf , New York, the

municipal corporation described in and which executed the within
ingtrument; that the same was so executed pursuant to resolution of
the Town Board of such town; that the seal affiwxed to said instrument
is such corporate seal and that the same was so affixed pursuant to
such resolution.

NOTARY PUBLIC



Rensselaer County
Snow Removol Potrof 2613.2014

Town Of Schodack
F776 U.S. Route 20 Dute:
Nossaw, MY F2F23
(518)766-4000
EQUEFMENT CPERATOR'S DAILY REPORT
Holidays
Thne i 1.5 2.5
County Route #38 Stoay Poiet Roud Reguiar Gvertime Dvertime Selery | Benefits TOTAL
Labor/Hame From To Total Howrs | Total Hours Total Hours Rafe™ | Hourly Rute Dellars
Tin Haberlond $ N2y 17258 S 34.45
BOperotor #2
$ 37288F 1253 |§ 4541
$ 580y 1253 1% 67.33
Frank Bali $12.66] 408 16.74
iWiugman
§ 1699 408 |3 2347
iEquipmen? | Truck# Hrs. Truck/Wing Plow Sander Redio
Truck 36,000 GVWR 5 £5001% 55018 150 § 71.00
Base Rate “Fuel* TOTAL TOTAL
Moterials 3 [ Ton intrease $/Ton Tons
SAND | 5 99 § 900
SALT @5 per St Contract{Internationnd Salf tf 4‘9; a5 ﬁ@ﬂwfy Yard {sﬁ%}%? -/ 5 fﬁififﬁ $ -
SAND/SALY MIX : |
TOTAL Dollars { Laber [ Fquipment | Matericls
RATE IS DETERMINED EACK WEEK
EERDM THURSDAY-->FOLLOWING WEDNISDAY
Highway Superinfendani
Weﬂflier?ﬂm ’’’’’ m’n’m‘“’u“—i Henneth J. Holmes

Instrugtions:

tach patral will be assigned to o territory. His duty will be to deaa alf the County Roads in his serritory the hall width of the roadway,

¢

Snow will be pushed buck os for us possible to provide roam for futer snow falls.

N

At the end of euch day's work this report must be mode out and mailed fo this office.

™ Benefits Rate peid 57.16% for Full-time Employees

32.20% for Wingman Part-time Employees

Ho tima will be alfowed for anyone not regularly nssigned to this work and whose nomes de not apgear on this regort.




FEDERAL EMERGENCY MANAGEMENT AGENCY

APPLICANT'S BENEFITS CALCULATION WORKSHEET

APPLICANT: Town of Schodack
DISASTER NUMBER:
PA D
PROJECT NUMBER:
TOTAL PAYROLL N DOLLARS: $ 679.094.53
Dollars OVERTIHME %
and Hours REGULAR TIME % PARTTHE %
Holidays 96 4.62 X
Vacation Leave 132 6.35 X
Sick Leave 104 5.00 X
* Social Security 6.20 * 6.20
* Medicare 1.45 * 1.45
* Unemployment § - n/a * n/a
* Workman's Compensation $§ 52,714.00 8.57 * 8.57
** Refirement $ 46,258.00 15.98 ** 15.98
Health Benefits $ 86,082.63 9.00 X
Life Insurance Benefits $ . 0 nia
Disability X X
Total (in % of annual salary) 5717 % 3220 %

| CERTIFY THAT THE INFORMATION ABOVE WAS TRANSCRIBED FROM PAYROLL
RECORDS OR OTHER DOCUMENTS WHICH ARE AVAILABLE FOR AUDIT.

CERTIFIED

TITLE; SUPERINTENDENT OF HIGHWAYS
DATE:




The aftached Snow Removal Reporls reflects a pay increase for 2013
Benefit percentaga has heen applied to the same.
The following chart shows the applicable pay rates with benefits

for all classes.

2013 PayRate X57.17% Pay Rate /
with Benefits]

EForeman/Senior Mechanic 18 2316 13240872 $ 36.40
15 8 3474  13.240572 5 47.98

2% 4832  13.240572 5 59.50

25 % 5790 13240572 $ 71.14

Water Sewer Operator Class C 1§ 22985 13120515 3 36.07
15§ 3443 13120515 $ 47 .55

2§ 4590 13120515 S 58.02

25§ 5738 13.120815 b 70.50

Operator #3 18 2203 12594551 $ 3462
15 & 33056 12504551 $ 45.64

285 4408 12594551 $ 56.65

25 § 5508 12594551 $ G7.67

iCperator #2 1% 2192 12531664 % 34.45
15 % 2288 12531664 $ 4541

25 4384 12531664 $ 56.37

25§ 5480 12531664 $ £7.33

Operator #1 18 2125  12.148625 $ 3340
15 § 3188 12148625 $ 4442

28 4250 12148825 $ 54,65

25 § 8313 12.148825 $ 65.27

fLaborer 18 1269  11.256773 ] 30.85
1.5 % 2854  11.256773 5 40,78

28 3838  11.258773 $ 50.64

25 § 4923  11.256773 $ 60.48

fWingman 2012 PayRate X 32.20% Pay Rate /
ingmen: are not paid averiime with Benefits

ith the exception of major Holidays 1 $ 1266 407652 ?3 16.74




The attached Snow Removat Reports reflects a pay increase for 2014
Benefit percentage has been applied to the same.
The following chart shows the applicable pay rates with benefits

for alf classes.

2014 PayRate 57.17% Pay Rate /

with Benefits

Foreman/Senior Mechanic 1§ 2357 13474960 $ 37.04
1.5 § 3536 13474968 § 48.83

25 4714 13.47496% 3 60.61

25 % 5893 13474968 3 7240

[Water Sewer Operator Class C 1§ 2341 13383497 3 36.79
15 § 3512  13.383497 $ 48.50

2% 4682  13.383497 3 60.20

25§ 5853  13.383497 $ 71.91

EOperator #3 1§ 2286  13.088082 $ 3593
158 3429  13.068062 5 4738

25 4577 12060062 $ 58.78

25 %8 5715  13.069062 $ 71022

{Operator 42 1§ 2230 12.74891 5 35.05
15 8% 3345 12.74891 $ 46.20

2% 4480 12.74891 3 57.35

25§ 8575 12.74881 3 68.50

Operator #1 1% 2162 12360154 $ 33.98
15§ 3243 12380154 $ 44.79

2% 4324 12360154 $ 5560

25 % 54056 12360154 $ 66.41

fLaborer 185 2003 11451151 3 31.48
158 3005 11451151 3 41.50

2% 4006 11451151 § 51.51

25 % 5008 11451151 $ 61.53

fWingman 2012 PayRate X3220% Pay Rate /
Wingenen are ot paid overlime with Benefits
with the exception of major Hofidays 1 $ 12.88 414738 $ 17.03




