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Town of Schodack 
Town Board Meeting 
November 12, 2020 

 
 

Public Session - 7 p.m.      
 
Call to Order 

 
Pledge of Allegiance 

 
Roll Call 
 
Joining us via Zoom:        
 
Presentation –  

 

 
 
Public Comment – will be received via emails up to 6:30 p.m. on Thursday, November 12th  
Deb.curtis@Schodack.org  
 
NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED THAT THE TOWN BOARD OF THE TOWN OF 
SCHODACK DOES HEREBY: 
 
2020-267) WHEREAS, the Town Board of the Town of Schodack (“Town Board”) is 

considering the establishment of  Battisti Water District No. 10 within the Town of 

Schodack (“Battisti Water District”) as described in the Map, Plan and Report that 

has been prepared for the Battisti Water District and which has been filed with the 

Town Clerk of the Town of Schodack in accordance with the requirements of the 

Town Law; and 

 
WHEREAS, such map, plan and report was prepared by Laberge Group, 
competent engineers, duly licensed by the State of New York, showing the 
boundaries of the proposed District, general plan of the District, the improvements 
to be made to the District, and a report showing the costs thereof; and 
 
WHEREAS, an order was adopted by the Town Board of the Town of Schodack 
on June 11, 2020, reciting the filing of the map, the improvements proposed, the 
estimated expense thereof, the proposed method of financing, the fact that the 
map, plan and report are on file in the Town Clerk’s Office for public inspection, 
and all other matters required by law to be stated; and 
 
WHEREAS, the order set July 9, 2020 at 7:05 p.m. at the Schodack Town Hall, 
265 Schuurman Road,  Castleton, New York as the date, time and place of the 
public hearing to consider the map, plan and report, and to hear all persons 
interested in the subject, and to take action as required and authorized by law; and  

Watch via livestreaming https://townhallstreams.com/towns/schodack 

mailto:Deb.curtis@Schodack.org
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WHEREAS, a public hearing on the establishment of the Battisti Water Extension 
was duly conducted by the Town Board on July 9, 2020 at 7:05 p.m. at the 
Schodack Town Hall; and 
 
WHEREAS, the Notice of Public Hearing was published, posted and filed as 
required by Law, and is otherwise sufficient;  
 
NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT:  
 
RESOLVED, that the permission of the Office of the State Comptroller is required 
with respect to the creation of the Battisti Water District; and be it further 
 
RESOLVED, that the Town Supervisor of the Town of Schodack be authorized to 
sign the Town of Schodack’s application to the Office of the State Comptroller for 
the Battisti Water District pursuant to Section 194 of the Town Law and the Part 
85 Regulations of the Office of the State Comptroller, and be it further 
 
RESOLVED, that the application to the Office of the State Comptroller was 
prepared at the direction of the town board; and be it further 
 
RESOLVED, that the town board of the town of Schodack believes the contents of 
the application to be accurate; and be it further 
 
RESOLVED, that the town board of the town of Schodack has determined that the 
proposed water district creation for which permission is sought is in the public 
interest and will not constitute an undue burden on the real property which will bear 
the cost thereof; and be it further 
 
RESOLVED, the cost of the proposed improvements shall be assessed in whole 
or in part against the benefited area and that all real property so assessed will be 
benefited by the proposed improvements and that no benefited property has been 
excluded; and be it further 
 
RESOLVED, that duplicate copies of the aforesaid application be filed with the 
Office of the State Comptroller. 
 

2020-268) NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, that the water rate for the sale of excess 

water supply for operations and maintenance pursuant to Sale of Water, for the 

period of January 1,  through December 31, 2021  to be charged by Bulk 

Commercial Water Sales from Enterprise Town-Wide Water Supply is $10.00 per 

1,000 gallons or portion thereof. 

 

2020-269) NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, that the water rate for the sale of excess 

water supply for operations and maintenance pursuant to Sale of Water, for the 

period of January 1,  through December 31, 2021 to be charged by Water District 

No. 1 to Water District No. 3 is $4.00 per 1,000 gallons or portion thereof. 

 
2020-270) NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, that the water rate for the sale of excess 
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water supply for operations and maintenance pursuant to Sale of Water Service 

Contract dated June 24, 2010 (Resolution No. 2010-229), for the period of January 

1, 2021 through December 31, 2021 to be charged by the Town-Wide Water 

Supply Enterprise Fund to Schodack Consolidated Water District No. 101 is $2.00 

per 1,000 gallons or portion thereof. 

 
2020-271) WHEREAS, the Town Board of the Town of Schodack, Rensselaer County has 

completed its review of the water rates for Water District No. 1 (Clearview), and  

WHEREAS, the Town Board caused due notice of the public hearing to consider 
proposed water rates to be published according to law, and  
 
WHEREAS, the Town Board did meet at the Town Hall, 265 Schuurman Road, 
Castleton-on-Hudson, New York on the 27th day of October 2020, said hearing 
being duly convened at the time and place specified in said notice, and  
 
WHEREAS, the Town Board considered public comment on said proposed water 
rates,  
 
NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED that commencing with the first quarter 
2021 billing period for water rates for Water District No. 1 (Clearview) for 168 users 
shall be $50.00 for the first 18,000 gallons and $4.00 for each additional 1,000 
gallons or portion thereof. 
 

2020-272) WHEREAS, the Town Board of the Town of Schodack, Rensselaer County, has 

completed an assessment roll in connection with the financing of improvements to 

the water system in Water District No. 1 (Clearview), and filed the same with the 

Town Clerk of the Town of Schodack, and 

 
WHEREAS, the Town Board caused due notice and publication of the completion 
of the assessment roll and of a hearing to be held by the Town Board to meet and 
consider any comments regarding said assessment roll to be held on October 27, 
2020 at 7:10 p.m. at the Schodack Town Hall located at 265 Schuurman Road, 
Castleton-on-Hudson, New York and 
 
WHEREAS, the Town Board did meet at the Town Hall, 265 Schuurman Road, 
Castleton-on-Hudson, New York on the 27th of October 2020, the time and place 
as specified in said notice to receive and consider any comments regarding the 
assessment roll, 
 
NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED that the said assessment roll be and the 
same is hereby affirmed for 240 units and adopted on October 27, 2020 and filed 
in the office of the Town Clerk of the Town of Schodack.  

  
2020-273) WHEREAS, the Town Board of the Town of Schodack, Rensselaer County has 

completed its review of the water rates for Water District No. 3 (Maplecrest), and  

 
WHEREAS, the Town Board caused due notice of the public hearing to consider 
proposed water rates to be published according to law, and  
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WHEREAS, the Town Board did meet at the Town Hall, 265 Schuurman Road, 
Castleton-on-Hudson, New York on the 27th day of October 2020, said hearing 
being duly convened at the time and place specified in said notice, and  
 
WHEREAS, the Town Board considered public comment on said proposed water 
rates,  
 
NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED that commencing with the first quarter 
2021 billing period for water rates for Water District No. 3 (Maplecrest) for 44 users 
shall be $75.00 for the first 18,000 gallons and $4.00 for each additional 1,000 
gallons or portion thereof. 

 
2020-274) WHEREAS, the Town Board of the Town of Schodack, Rensselaer County, has 

completed an assessment roll in connection with the financing of improvements to 

water system in Water District No. 3 (Maplecrest) and filed the same with the Town 

Clerk of the Town of Schodack, and 

 
WHEREAS, the Town Board caused due notice and publication of the completion 
of the assessment roll and of a hearing to be held by the Town Board to meet and 
consider any comments regarding said assessment roll to be held on October 27, 
2020 at 7:10 p.m. at the Schodack Town Hall located at 265 Schuurman Road, 
Castleton-on-Hudson, New York and 
 
WHEREAS, the Town Board did meet at the Town Hall, 265 Schuurman Road, 
Castleton-on-Hudson, New York on the 27th of October 2020, the time and place 
as specified in said notice to receive and consider any comments regarding the 
assessment roll, 
 
NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED that the said assessment roll be and the 
same is hereby affirmed for 44.5 units and adopted on October 27, 2020 and filed 
in the office of the Town Clerk of the Town of Schodack.  

 
2020-275) WHEREAS, the Town Board of the Town of Schodack, Rensselaer County has 

completed its review of the water rates for Consolidated Water District No. 101, 

and  

 
WHEREAS, the Town Board caused due notice of the public hearing to consider 
proposed water rates to be published according to law, and  
 
WHEREAS, the Town Board did meet at the Town Hall, 265 Schuurman Road, 
Castleton-on-Hudson, New York on the 27th day of October 2020, said hearing 
being duly convened at the time and place specified in said notice, and  
 
WHEREAS, the Town Board considered public comment on said proposed water 
rates,  
 
NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED that commencing with the first quarter 
2021 billing period for water rates for Water District No. 101 for 394 existing users 
shall be $45.00 for the first 18,000 gallons and $3.00 for each additional 1,000 
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gallons or portion thereof,  
 
FURTHER RESOLVE that commencing with the first quarter 2020 billing period 
water rates for residential out of district users for Water District No. 101 for 7 
existing users shall be $140.00 for the first 18,000 gallons and $3.00 for each 
additional 1,000 gallons or portion thereof.   

 
2020-276) WHEREAS, the Town Board of the Town of Schodack, Rensselaer County, has 

completed an assessment roll for Consolidated Water District No. 101 (formerly 

Water Districts Nos. 2a, 2b, 4, 5, 8 and 9) and filed the same with the Town Clerk 

of the Town of Schodack, and 

 
WHEREAS, the Town Board caused due notice and publication of the completion 
of the assessment roll and of a hearing to be held by the Town Board to meet and 
consider any comments regarding said assessment roll to be held on October 27, 
2020 at 7:10 p.m. at the Schodack Town Hall located at 265 Schuurman Road, 
Castleton-on-Hudson, New York and 
 
WHEREAS, the Town Board did meet at the Town Hall, 265 Schuurman Road, 
Castleton-on-Hudson, New York on the 27th of October 2020, the time and place 
as specified in said notice to receive and consider any comments regarding the 
assessment roll, 
 
NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, that the said assessment roll be and the 
same is hereby affirmed for 958 units and adopted on October 27, 2020 and filed 
in the office of the Town Clerk of the Town of Schodack. 

 
2020-277) WHEREAS, the Town Board of the Town of Schodack, Rensselaer County, has 

completed an assessment roll in connection with the financing of improvements to 

the water system in Water District No. 2A (Inglewood) and filed the same with the 

Town Clerk of the Town of Schodack, and 

 
WHEREAS, pursuant to Resolution 2009-378 adopted on August 27, 2009, it 
was determined by the Town Board of the Town of Schodack to be in the public 
interest to consolidate six existing water districts to be known as Consolidated 
Water District No. 101, and  

 
WHEREAS, it was further determined that any costs of outstanding indebtedness 
for improvements to the districts consolidated would remain the obligation of each 
said district, and  
 
WHEREAS, the Town Board caused due notice and publication of the completion 
of the assessment roll and of a hearing to be held by the Town Board to meet and 
consider any comments regarding said assessment roll to be held on October 27, 
2020 at 7:10 p.m. at the Schodack Town Hall located at 265 Schuurman Road, 
Castleton-on-Hudson, New York and 
 
WHEREAS, the Town Board did meet at the Town Hall, 265 Schuurman Road, 
Castleton-on-Hudson, New York on the 27th of October 2020, the time and place 
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as specified in said notice to receive and consider any comments regarding the 
assessment roll, 
 
NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED that the said assessment roll be and the 
same is hereby affirmed for 33.5 units and adopted on October 27, 2020 and filed 
in the office of the Town Clerk of the Town of Schodack. 

 
2020-278) WHEREAS, the Town Board of the Town of Schodack, Rensselaer County, has 

completed an assessment roll in connection with the financing of improvements to 

water system in Water District No. 8 (Schodack Center), and filed the same with 

the Town Clerk of the Town of Schodack, and 

  WHEREAS, pursuant to Resolution 2009-378 adopted on August 27, 2009, it was 
determined by the Town Board of the Town of Schodack to be in the public interest 
to consolidate six existing water districts to be known as Consolidated Water 
District No. 101, and  

 
  WHEREAS, it was further determined that any costs of outstanding indebtedness 

for improvements to the districts consolidated would remain the obligation of each 
said district, and  

 
  WHEREAS, the Town Board caused due notice and publication of the completion 

of the assessment roll and of a hearing to be held by the Town Board to meet and 
consider any comments regarding said assessment roll to be held on October 27, 
2020 at 7:10 p.m. at the Schodack Town Hall located at 265 Schuurman Road, 
Castleton-on-Hudson, New York and 

 
  WHEREAS, the Town Board did meet at the Town Hall, 265 Schuurman Road, 

Castleton-on-Hudson, New York on the 27th of October 2020, the time and place 
as specified in said notice to receive and consider any comments regarding the 
assessment roll, 

 
  NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED that the said assessment roll be and the 

same is hereby affirmed for 248.5 units and adopted on October 27, 2020 and filed 
in the office of the Town Clerk of the Town of Schodack.  

 
2020-279) WHEREAS, the Town Board of the Town of Schodack, Rensselaer County, has 

completed an assessment roll in connection with the financing of improvements to 

the water system in Water District No. 9 (Highway Garage/Route 20) and filed the 

same with the Town Clerk of the Town of Schodack, and 

  WHEREAS, pursuant to Resolution 2009-378 adopted on August 27, 2009, it was 
determined by the Town Board of the Town of Schodack to be in the public interest 
to consolidate six existing water districts to be known as Consolidated Water 
District No. 101, and  

 
  WHEREAS, it was further determined that any costs of outstanding indebtedness 

for improvements to the districts consolidated would remain the obligation of each 
said district, and  
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  WHEREAS, the Town Board caused due notice and publication of the completion 
of the assessment roll and of a hearing to be held by the Town Board to meet and 
consider any comments regarding said assessment roll to be held on October 27, 
2020 at 7:10 p.m. at the Schodack Town Hall located at 265 Schuurman Road, 
Castleton-on-Hudson, New York and 

 
  WHEREAS, the Town Board did meet at the Town Hall, 265 Schuurman Road, 

Castleton-on-Hudson, New York on the 27th of October 2020, the time and place 
as specified in said notice to receive and consider any comments regarding the 
assessment roll, 

 
  NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED that the said assessment roll be and the 

same is hereby affirmed for 211.75 units and adopted on October 27, 2020 and 
filed in the office of the Town Clerk of the Town of Schodack.  

 
2020-280) WHEREAS, a resolution was duly adopted by the Town Board of the Town of 

Schodack to schedule a public hearing to be held on October 27, 2020 to consider 

proposed sewer rents for Sewer District No. 6 (Exit 10) and  

  WHEREAS, due notice of the public hearing was published according to law, and 
 
  WHEREAS, the Town Board did meet at the Town Hall, 265 Schuurman Road, 

Castleton-on-Hudson, New York, on the 27th day of October 2020, said hearing 
being duly convened at the time and place specified in said notice, and  

 
  WHEREAS, the Town Board considered public comment on said proposed sewer 

rates,  
 
  NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED that commencing with the first quarter 

2020 billing period for the sewer rents for Sewer District No. 6 (Exit 10) for 71 users 
shall be $7.75 per thousand based on water meter.   

 
2020-281) WHEREAS, a resolution was duly adopted by the Town Board of the Town of 

Schodack to schedule a public hearing to be held on October 27, 2020 to consider 

proposed sewer rents for Sewer District No. 5 (East Schodack) and  

  WHEREAS, due notice of the public hearing was published according to law, and 
 
  WHEREAS, the Town Board did meet at the Town Hall, 265 Schuurman Road, 

Castleton-on-Hudson, New York, on the 27th day of October 2020, said hearing 
being duly convened at the time and place specified in said notice, and  

 
  WHEREAS, the Town Board considered public comment on said proposed sewer 

rates,  
 
  NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED that commencing with the semi-annual 

billing period (January 1, 2021 to June 30, 2021) the sewer rents for Sewer District 
No. 5 (East Schodack) for 28 users shall be $400.00 semi-annual rate per unit. 

 
2020-282) WHEREAS, the Town Board of the Town of Schodack, Rensselaer County, has 
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completed an assessment roll in connection with the financing of Sewer District 

No. 5, Extension 1 (East Schodack) Capital Costs of the collection system and that 

portion of non-reimbursed Capital Costs of the East Schodack Sewage collection 

system and filed the same with the Town Clerk of the Town of Schodack, and  

  WHEREAS, the Town Board caused due notice and publication of the completion 
of the assessment roll and of a hearing to be held by the Town Board to receive 
and consider any comments regarding said assessment roll to be held on October 
27, 2020 at 7:20 p.m. at the Schodack Town Hall located at 265 Schuurman Road, 
Castleton-on-Hudson, New York, and  

 
  WHEREAS, the Town Board did meet at the Town Hall, 265 Schuurman Road, 

Castleton-on-Hudson, on the 27th of October, 2020, the time and place specified 
in said hearing to receive and consider any comments regarding the assessment 
roll for Sewer District No. 5, Extension 1, 

 
  NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED that the said assessment roll be and the 

same is hereby affirmed for Extension 1 as 30 units and filed in the office of the 
Town Clerk of the Town of Schodack. 

 
2020-283) WHEREAS, the Town Board of the Town of Schodack, Rensselaer County, has 

completed an assessment roll in connection with the financing of Sewer District 

No. 5, Extensions 1 and 2 (East Schodack) Capital Costs of the collection system 

and that portion of non-reimbursed Capital Costs of the East Schodack Sewage 

collection system and filed the same with the Town Clerk of the Town of Schodack, 

and  

  WHEREAS, the Town Board caused due notice and publication of the completion 
of the assessment roll and of a hearing to be held by the Town Board to receive 
and consider any comments regarding said assessment roll to be held on October 
27, 2020 at 7:20 p.m. at the Schodack Town Hall located at 265 Schuurman Road, 
Castleton-on-Hudson, New York, and  

 
  WHEREAS, the Town Board did meet at the Town Hall, 265 Schuurman Road, 

Castleton-on-Hudson, on the 27th of October, 2020, the time and place specified 
in said hearing to receive and consider any comments regarding the assessment 
roll for Sewer District No. 5, Extensions 1 and 2, 

 
  NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED that the said assessment roll be and the 

same is hereby affirmed for Extensions 1 and 2 as 32 units and filed in the office 
of the Town Clerk of the Town of Schodack. 

 
2020-284) WHEREAS, a resolution was duly adopted by the Town Board of the Town of 

Schodack to schedule a public hearing to be held on October 27, 2020 to consider 

proposed sewer rents for Sewer District No. 8 (Schodack Landing) and  

 
WHEREAS, due notice of the public hearing was published according to law, and 
 
WHEREAS, the Town Board did meet at the Town Hall, 265 Schuurman Road, 
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Castleton-on-Hudson, New York, on the 27th day of October 2020, said hearing 
being duly convened at the time and place specified in said notice, and  
 
WHEREAS, the Town Board considered public comment on said proposed sewer 
rates,  
 
NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED that commencing with the semi-annual 
billing period (January 1, 2021 to June 30, 2021) the sewer rents for Sewer District 
No. 8 (Schodack Landing) for 71 units shall be $185.00 semi-annual rate per unit. 

 
2020-285) WHEREAS, the Town Board of the Town of Schodack, Rensselaer County, has 

completed an assessment roll in connection with the financing of Sewer District 

No. 8 (Schodack Landing) Capital Costs of the collection system and that portion 

of non-reimbursed Capital Costs of the Schodack Landing Sewage collection 

system and filed the same with the Town Clerk of the Town of Schodack, and  

 
WHEREAS, the Town Board caused due notice and publication of the completion 
of the assessment roll and of a hearing to be held by the Town Board to receive 
and consider any comments regarding said assessment roll to be held on October 
27, 2020 at 7:20 p.m. at the Schodack Town Hall located at 265 Schuurman Road, 
Castleton-on-Hudson, New York, and  
 
WHEREAS, the Town Board did meet at the Town Hall, 265 Schuurman Road, 
Castleton-on-Hudson, on the 27th of October 2020, the time and place specified 
in said hearing to receive and consider any comments regarding the assessment 
roll, 
 
NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED that the said assessment roll be and is 
the same is hereby affirmed for 77 units and filed in the office of the Town Clerk of 
the Town of Schodack. 
 

2020-286) WHEREAS, a resolution was duly adopted by the Town Board of the Town of 

Schodack to schedule a public hearing to be held on October 27, 2020 to consider 

proposed sewer rents for Castleton Consolidation Sewer District No. No. 1 

(Castleton) and  

  WHEREAS, due notice of the public hearing was published according to law, and 
 
  WHEREAS, the Town Board did meet at the Town Hall, 265 Schuurman Road, 

Castleton-on-Hudson, New York, on the 27th day of October 2020, said hearing 
being duly convened at the time and place specified in said notice, and  

 
  WHEREAS, the Town Board considered public comment on said proposed sewer 

rates,  
 
  NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED that commencing with the semi-annual 

billing period (January 1, 2021 to June 30, 2021) the sewer rents for Castleton 
Consolidation Sewer District No. 1 (Formerly - Castleton, Castleridge, Brickyard 
and Hamilton) for 194 users shall be $220.00 semi-annual rate per unit. 
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2020-287) Ratify and affirm that the adjustments to the 2021 Tentative Budget are as 
follows:

 
 

2020-288) Based on October 27th 2020 budget discussions, adopt the following changes 
to the 2021 Preliminary  Budget as follows:   
 

2020-289) WHEREAS, the Town Board met on Tuesday, October 27, 2020 at the 
Schodack Town Hall, as specified in the Notice of Public Hearing for the 2020 
Preliminary Budget, with said notice appearing in the October 20, 2020 edition 
of The Record, and was posted on October 20, 2020, and  

Town of Schodack

Tentative to Preliminary Budget Analysis*

2021

+/- +/- AMOUNT TO

APPROPRIATIONS ESTIMATED UNEXPENDED BE RAISED

  PROVISIONS REVENUE BALANCE BY  TAXES

Tentative Budget 12,733,595.00         4,760,534.00 1,172,436.00 6,800,625.00  

A1010.1 Town Board (800.00)                     -                   -                   (800.00)            

A1010.4 Town Board (1,800.00)                  -                   -                   (1,800.00)         

A1110.4 Justice 2,800.00                   -                   2,800.00         -                    

A1220.4 Supervisor (1,300.00)                  -                   -                   (1,300.00)         

A1330.4 Tax Receiver (675.00)                     -                   -                   (675.00)            

A1355.1 Assessor (2,557.00)                  -                   -                   (2,557.00)         

A1355.4 Assessor (950.00)                     -                   -                   (950.00)            

A1410.4 Town Clerk 450.00                      -                   450.00             -                    

A1430.4 Personnel (500.00)                     -                   -                   (500.00)            

A1620.4 Buildings (1,300.00)                  -                   -                   (1,300.00)         

A3120.4 Police 750.00                      -                   750.00             -                    

A3510.1 Control of Animals (15,998.00)               -                   -                   (15,998.00)      

A3510.4 Control of Animals 15,998.00                 -                   -                   15,998.00        

A7310.1 Youth Programs (2,600.00)                  -                   -                   (2,600.00)         

A8389 Water Miscellaneous 305.00                      -                   -                   305.00             

A9030.8 FICA (1,690.00)                  -                   (81.00)              (1,609.00)         

Net A Fund Adjustment (9,867.00)                  -                   3,919.00         (13,786.00)      

B8010.1 Zonning (156.00)                     (156.00)           -                    

B8020.1 Planning (418.00)                     (418.00)           -                    

B9030.8 Social Security (40.00)                       (40.00)              -                    

Net B Fund Adjustment (614.00)                     -                   (614.00)           -                    

DB5110.1 Street Maintenance (38,885.00)               (38,885.00)      -                    

DB5112.1 Road Construction (2,777.00)                  (2,777.00)        -                    

DB5130.1 Machinery (6,605.00)                  (6,605.00)        -                    

DB5140.1 Brush & Weeds (1,365.00)                  (1,365.00)        -                    

DB5142.1 Snow Removal (8,737.00)                  (8,737.00)        -                    

DB9010.8 State Retirement 240.00                      240.00             -                    

DB9030.8 FICA 2,190.00                   2,190.00         -                    

DB-962 Capital Reserve 30,000.00                 30,000.00       -                    

Net DB Fund Adjustment (25,939.00)               -                   (25,939.00)      -                    

EW2801 Interfund Transfer -                             (5,710.00)        5,710.00         -                    

Net EW Fund Adjustment -                             (5,710.00)        5,710.00         -                    

SF1 3410.4 Fire Protection Districts 1,350.00                   -                   -                   1,350.00          

Net SF1 Fund Adjustment 1,350.00                   -                   -                   1,350.00          

SS5 Net SS5 Fund Adjustment 300.00                      -                   300.00             -                    

SS6 Net SS6 Fund Adjustment 1,000.00                   -                   1,000.00         -                    

SS8 Net SS8 Fund Adjustment 470.00                      -                   470.00             -                    

SSC1 Net SSC1 Fund Adjustment (2,540.00)                  (2,240.00)        (300.00)           -                    

SW1 Net SW1 Fund Adjustment 535.00                      135.00             400.00             -                    

SW9 2801 Interfund Revenue -                             (72.00)              72.00                

Net SW9 Fund Adjustment -                             (72.00)              -                   72.00                

SWC 1990.4 Contingency (278.00)                     (278.00)            

SWC 8340-4 Trans & Distrib Contractual (5,710.00)                  416.00             200.00             (6,326.00)         

SWC 9060.8 Medical Isurance - Active 478.00                      478.00             

Net SWC Fund Adjustment (5,510.00)                  416.00             200.00             (6,126.00)         

South Schodack Fire District 274,304.00              200.00             -                   274,104.00     

Schodack Center Fire District 9,260.00                   -                   5,667.00         3,593.00          

East Schodack Fire District 199,132.00              92,050.00       -                   107,082.00     

Schodack Valley Fire District 203,082.00              1,000.00         -                   202,082.00     

Nassau Fire District 193,843.00              188,101.00     -                   5,742.00          

Preliminary Budget per 10/27/20 TB mtg 13,572,401.00         5,034,414.00 1,163,249.00 7,374,738.00  

*The Tax Base will be updated with the latest assessment data, therefore an updated exemption impact report will be included with the preliminary budget.
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WHEREAS, said public hearing was held on October 27, 2020 at 7:30 p.m. at 
the Schodack Town Hall and all parties in attendance were permitted an 
opportunity to speak on behalf of, or in opposition to, said Preliminary Budget 
or any part thereof,  
 
NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED that the 2021 Preliminary Budget, and 
as hereinafter set forth, is hereby adopted. 

 

2020-290) Authorize $170,000.00 to be transferred into the Highway (DB Fund) Capital 
Reserve Fund.  
 

2020-291) Authorize $50,000.00 to be transferred into the Town Wide (A Fund) Police 
Vehicle Capital Reserve Fund. 
 

2020-292) Approve the attached Transfer Station Fee schedule, to be effective January 
1, 2021.  

 

(518) 477-8491 
 
 

TOWN OF SCHODACK TRANSFER/RECYCLING 
STATION RULES AND 
REGULATIONS 

For more information on our Transfer Station please visit  
http://www.schodack.org/transfer-station-and-recycling 

 
1) The Town of Schodack Transfer/Recycling Station is for use by Town residents only and is for 

disposal of refuse generated within the Town of Schodack. Proof of residency and vehicle 
registration must be provided in order to utilize facility. 

 

2) Credit cards, personal checks or money orders are acceptable forms of payment at the 
Transfer Station. For credit card use, a convenience fee of $1.75 or 2.45% (whichever is 
higher) will be applied to each transaction.  
 

Brush will be accepted up to 30 minutes before closing each day. 
 

3) The Schodack Transfer/Recycling Station area shall be open for disposal as follows: 
 

Tuesday 7:00 a.m. - 5:00 p.m. 
Wednesday 7:00 a.m. - 2:00 p.m. 
Thursday 7:00 a.m. - 2:00 p.m. 
Friday 7:00 a.m. - 2:00 p.m. 
Saturday 7:00 a.m. - 3:00 p.m. 

 

The Transfer Station is closed all day Sunday, Monday and Holidays as posted. 
 

4) Residents will be required to pay for each 30-gallon bag, or portion thereof, of refuse 
disposed of as follows: 

 

a) 52-bag punch card $ 104.00 
b) 12-Bag Punch Card $ 30.00 
c) 30-gallon bag or equivalent $     3.00 each 

 (Previously purchased punch cards will be honored)  

http://www.schodack.org/transfer-station-and-recycling
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5) There will be an additional charge for: 
 

a) Refrigerators, freezers, dehumidifiers, air conditioners*** $12.00 each or 6 punches 
b) Metal goods: $ 6.00 each or 3 punches 

Stoves, washers, dryers, water 
tanks, riding lawn mowers, 
Bulk metals 

 

c) 
 
 

d) 

Tires (car and light truck) 
Tires with rims 
Larger tires 
Bulky furniture ** 

$ 4.00 each or 2 punches 
$ 6.00 each or 3 punches 
*PRICED BY SIZE* 
$10.00 each or 5 punches 

e) 
f) 
g) 
h) 
i) 

Household construction debris, 30 gallon container 
Propane tanks 
Push Mowers 
Gas Grills, Bicycles 
Televisions, Computers, Monitor & 

$10.00 each or 5 punches 
$ 6.00 each or 3 punches 
$ 5.00 each or 3 punches 
$ 5.00 each or 3 punches 
FREE 

 
j) 
k) 

Rear Projection Televisions *** 
Computer tower only *** 
Misc. Electronic – printers, copiers, typewriters, 
radios, microwaves *** 

FREE 

FREE 

**Bulky Furniture, i.e.: Sofas, stuffed chairs, mattresses, box springs, rugs etc. 
***All Electronics not containing Freon 
 

The Director of the Transfer/Recycling Station or his designee has sole authority to determine 
ultimate cost of bulky items brought in. 

 

6) RECYCLING IS MANDATORY. NO RECYCLABLES SHOULD BE PLACED IN THE 
REFUSE CONTAINER. 

 
7) THE FOLLOWING RECYCLABLES WILL BE ACCEPTED AT NO ADDITIONAL CHARGE: 

a) Newspapers/Magazines/Junk Mail – white paper. Books (hard & 
soft cover) Shredded paper (bagged) 

b) Tin cans 
c) Glass bottles/jars 
d) Plastic bottles or containers (only recyclable codes 1 - 7) 
e) Used oil and filters 
f) Batteries - car and rechargeable 
g) Anti-Freeze 
h) Corrugated cardboard/Box Board/Brown 
I) Clothes - Salvation Army container only 
j) Brush and logs less than four (4) inches in diameter 

 

8) MATERIALS PROHIBITED AT THE TOWN OF SCHODACK TRANSFER/RECYCLING 
STATION: 
a) Industrial waste 
b) Infectious waste 
c) Sludge 
d) Hazardous waste 
e) Commercial construction and demolition debris 
f) Trees and tree stumps 
g) Gas, Kerosene and Fuel Oil 
h) Ashes of any kind 

 
9) As a consideration to our neighbors, all open loads should be covered and secured while 

traveling to and from the Transfer Station. 
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Any violations of these rules and regulations will void tipping 
privileges.  
 
SPECIAL DATES & HOURS:  
 SPRING CLEAN-UP - May 13 14, and 15, 2021 7 A.M. through 3  P.M. 
 FALL CLEAN-UP - October 14, 15, and 19, 2019 7 A.M. through 3 P.M. 
 SHREDDING DAY – March 27th – East Greenbush 9 A.M. through 12 P.M. 

                                                          July 24th – Town of Schodack 9 A.M. through 12 P.M. 
                                                          October 30th – City of Rensselaer 9 A.M. through 12 P.M. 

 
 HOUSEHOLD HAZARDOUS WASTE DAY – None Scheduled for 2021 

 
The following days have been designated as 2021 holidays and the Transfer Station will be closed: 

 

Weekday Date Holiday 
Friday January 1 New Year’s Day * 
Tuesday June1 Memorial Day * 
Tuesday                   September7                            Labor Day* 
Thursday                                                        November25                            Thanksgiving Day 
Friday                                                                          November 26  Day after 

Thanksgiving 
Thanksgiving 

Saturday December 25 Christmas Day 
   

 

*Transfer Station is closed on Mondays; therefore, pursuant to the Collective 
Bargaining Agreement, Monday holidays will be observed on Tuesday. 

 
 

2020-293) Authorize Supervisor Harris to execute and administer purchase agreement 
dated October 23, 2020 with All Traffic Solutions to purchase 2 Solar powered 
Speed Alert Signs for an amount not to exceed $7,060.00. 

 
2020-294) Authorize the appropriation of the Federal Forfeiture Reserve Fund in the total 

amount not to exceed $7,460.00 for purchase of 2 Toughbook Laptops per 
quote dated October 27, 2020 from Telrepso Foersch Holding Inc. 

 
2020-295) Authorize the purchase of 2 Toughbook laptops from Telrepso Foersch Holding 

Inc. not to exceed $7,460.00. [contingent upon resolution 2020-294] 
 

2020-296) Authorize Supervisor Harris to execute a 3 year agreement with Unifirst Renew 
for exchange and cleaning of ten (10) floor mats on an every four-week basis 
at the Town Hall with UniFirst in an amount not to exceed $110.50 per 
exchange. 
 

2020-297) Declare 1 Roll off container at the Transfer Station as surplus and accept offer 
from Speedcor Industries, Inc. to purchase for $2,500.00   
 

2020-298) Authorize Director of Transfer Station to purchase one (1) Wastequip Model 
206742NE 40-yard roll-off and one (1) Top tube Upgrade Kit ROC201 per quote # 
WQ-10173302 dated November 4, 2020 from Wastequip for use at the transfer 
station in an amount not to exceed $5,387.00. 
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2020-299) Authorize Kerrie D. Joiner, Human Resource Manager to post internally the 
full-time positions of Staff Accountant for the Town of Schodack and allow the 
Supervisor to advertise in the official Town newspaper as necessary. 

 
2020-300) Authorize the selection of CDPHP-HMO Insurance for Health Insurance 

coverage effective January 1, 2021. 
 

2020-301) Authorize the selection of MVP-HMO Insurance for Health Insurance coverage 
effective January 1, 2021. 

 
2020-302) Authorize the selection of NYSHIP Empire Plan Insurance for Health Insurance 

coverage effective January 1, 2021, to employees hired prior to September 28, 
2006 (eligible at retirement). 

 
2020-303) Authorize the selection of Humana Medicare PPO Insurance coverage 

effective January 1, 2021.  
 

2020-304) Authorize the selection of ShelterPoint for Disability Insurance coverage 
effective January 1, 2021. 

 
2020-305) IT IS HEREBY RESOLVED, that the Town of Schodack hereby establishes 

the following as standard work day for the following elected official and will 
report the following days worked to the New York State and Local 
Employees' Retirement System based on the record of activities maintained 
and submitted by this official to the clerk of this body: 

 

Title Name 

Standard 
Work 
Day 
(Hrs/day) 

Term 
Begins/Ends 

Participates in 
Employer’s 
Time Keeping 
System (Y/N) 

Days/Month 
(based on 
Record of 
Activities) 

Not 
Submitted 
Record of 
Activities 
or T/S 

Elected Officials 

Town 

Board 

Member 

Michael 

Kenney 

7 1/1/20-

12/31/23 

N TBD Not 

Summited 

Court 

Justice 

Paul 

Peter 

7 1/1/20-

12/31/23 

N TBD Not 

Submitted 

Town 

Clerk 

Debra 

Curtis 

7 1/1/20-

12/31/23 

N  

22.93 

 

Tax 

Receiver 

Shawn 

Masters 

7 1/1/20-

12/31/23 

N TBD Not 

Submitted 
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Appointed Officials 

Planning 

Board 

Member 

Stephanie 

Leonard 

7 1/9/20-

12/31/26 

N TBD Not 

Submitted 

 
2020-306) Authorize Supervisor Harris to execute and administer an annual maintenance 

agreement with W. & E. Phillips Locksmith Inc. for software maintenance at the 
Town Hall in an amount not to exceed $375.00. 
 

2020-307) Authorize Supervisor Harris to execute and administer Roofing Contract dated 
November 12, 2020 in an amount not to exceed $_____________. 

 
2020-308) WHEREAS, the Town has determined that there is surplus chip and grass 

material at the Transfer Station generated during the 2020, and  
 

WHEREAS, the Town has determined that said surplus material needs to be 
removed to reduce a potential fire hazard, and  
 
WHEREAS, the Town has received 3 proposals for grinding material and 
removing it from the Transfer Station as follows: a proposal from Sylvan Timber 
Clearing Inc. for $7,500.00, , a proposal from Ken Morris & Sons Excavating, 
LLC for $6,500.00 and a proposal from SM Gallivan, L.L.C. for $9,875.00, 
 
NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED that pursuant to the recommendation 
of the Transfer Station Director, that the Town Board does hereby accepts Ken 
Morris & Sons Excavating, LLC. proposal in the sum of $6,500.00. 
 

2020-309) Authorize the Comptroller’s recommendation to direct the Town Supervisor to 
pay the claims #20-_____ to 20-_____ on Abstract No.  2020-11, in the amount 
of $______, including the claims paid $_______. 

 
2020-310) Authorize the October 2020 budget modifications, interfund loans and interfund 

transfers as provided in document dated November 2020 and recommended 
by the Comptroller.  

 
Motion to Adjourn 
 

Pursuant to the regulation of the Americans with Disabilities Act (Public Law 101-336), the  
Town of Schodack will provide auxiliary aids or special services for persons  

with disabilities.  Please notify the Town Clerk’s Office at 477-7590  
so arrangements can be made for requested services. 

 
Please forward correspondence regarding Town matters to: 

Supervisor David Harris 
Town of Schodack, 265 Schuurman Road 

Castleton-on-Hudson, New York 12033-9622 
or call the Supervisor at 518-477-7918  

 
1/9/2018 1:52 PM 

 


